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I R L , CJ {J /-/JI Allan C. MacDonald of Montreal has p e Q p e' been apj,ointed executive vice-president 

D. L. Thompson, former assistant 
director aircraft branch of DDP produc­
tion, has been appointed director. 

T. E. "Thor" Stephenson, former direc­
of aircraft division DDP, has been named 
sales engineering and service manager 
of Canadian Pratt & Whitney Co., Mont­
real. 

Walter R. McLachlan has been ap­
pointed president of Orenda Engines Ltd . 
Mr. McLachlan, formerly vice-president 
and general manager, will continue with 
his duties as general manager. 

* 
Servomechanisms Inc., parent company 

of Industrial Electronics of Canada Ltd., 
announces the election of Richard H. 
West as a director and member of the 
finance committee of the U. S. firm. 

* * * 

T. J. Bell has been appointed president 
of Fiberglas Canada, Ltd. W. E. Phillips, 
vice-chairman of the board, made the an­
nouncement of the executive vice-presi­
dent's promotion. 

* * * 

Major-General Robert M. Lee, USAF, 
who was filling two positions as com­
mander of NATO's Fourth Allied Tacti­
cal Air Force and the USAF's Twelfth 
Air Force, is now devoting fu ll time to 
his NATO command. One of the units 
of the NATO group is the First Canadian 
Air Division of the RCAF. 

* * 

Trans-Canada Air Lines rcently an­
nounced the appointment of A. J. War­
wick to the newly established position of 
director, mail traffic. 

of Canad ian Car & Foundry Co. Ltd. He 
comes to Can-Car from Canadian Pacific 
Steamships Ltd. where he had been a 
managing director. 

* 

J. C. Sullh,an of Peterborough , Ont., 
has been named chief traffic officer of the 
Air Transport Board following a Civil 
Service Commission competition. He was 
formerly Canadian traffic manager of the 
Quaker Oats Co. 

Timmins Aviation Ltd. announces the 
appointment of Floyd Leland, formerly 
of Algoma Steel, air transport division, as 
chief inspector. 

* 
Edward R. Nary has been appointed to 

the newly created post of manager, head­
quarters manufacturing department, of 
Canadian Westinghouse Co. Ltd. 

R. W. RYAN 

Canadian Pacific Airlines recently an­
nounced three appointments to top ex­
ecutive posts. R. W. Ryan, formerly vice­
president, becomes executive vice-pr.esi­
dent and director; R. B. Phi.Jl ips moves up 
from general manager operations to be­
come a vice-president in charge of that 
branch; H. B. Renwick has been raised 
from general manager to vice-president 
status in the sales and traffic department. 

* 
Ontario-born Captain Peter C. Fair, a 

former trans-Atlantic pilot for British 
Overseas Airways Corp., has been named 
general manager of Bahamas Airways 
Ltd ., an associate of BOAC. A native of 
Kingston, Captain Fair joined BOAC in 
1939 and logged more than 14,000 hours 
as a flight captain, including 400 Atlantic 
crossings, one of them a royal flight car­
rying H.R.H. Princess Margaret to the 
Bahamas in Feb., 1955. 

* * 
Computing Devices of Canada Ltd. has 

appointed R. G. (Bob) Powers technical 
sales representative in Toronto. 

* 
The Institute of the Aeronautical 

Sciences' Octave Chanute award for 1956 
has been presented to A. M. "Tex" Johns• 
ton, Boeing Airplane Co. chief of flight 
test. The award, for "a notable contribu­
tion made by a pilot to the aeronautical 
sciences," was made to Johnston on the 
basis of his excellent flight test work. 
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