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The Packard Motor Company of Wilmington in the 1930s: Frank W. Diver was the driving force 
and general manager of Wilmington’s Packard agency from 1922 until World War II. My father, 
Clarence Marshall, was his financial partner, who would stop in two or three times each week. The 
agency had three locations during the decade of the 1930s: a tall, narrow building at 10th and French 
streets (later a Sears tire store), a cramped one-story building on Pennsylvania Avenue between Union 
Street and Grant Avenue (later occupied by Food Fair), and a new building also on Pennsylvania 
Avenue between Grant Avenue and Bancroft Parkway, built in 1936 as a state-of-the-art dealership. 
This latter building, greatly expanded over the years, is the headquarters of Diver Chevrolet, now run 
by the third generation of Divers. 
 
In the original 1936 building, there was a showroom facing Pennsylvania Avenue that would easily 
display four or five Packards and either a Nash or a Studebaker (less expensive cars were also sold, in 
order, during the Depression). Behind the showroom in the center of the building was the business 
office. Mrs. Mountz kept the books, and she and Mr. Diver occupied this area. In back of the office was 
a large service department, with about five bays, each with its mechanic, and ample storage room for 
new and used cars, as well as privately-owned cars in for service. All the way back in the building was 
the wash rack and polishing area. 
 
Frank Diver himself was the chief salesman, and he had some prestigious accounts in a General Motors 
town. He sold a 1934 Packard Twelve to Pilling Wright of Newark and took a 1930 Minerva in trade 
(Wright was president of Continental Diamond Fibre Company, and his former home is the president’s 
house for the University of Delaware). When he sold another “Twelve” to Wilmer Stradley, president 
of Diamond Ice and Coal Company, a special front seat had to be substituted to accommodate Mr. 
Stradley’s 350-pound frame. Other Packard salesmen working for Diver were Warren Collins and 
Byron Rawson. I remember visiting one day in early 1937 when all had long faces; the stock market 
had just taken another plunge (fortunately, it picked up later that year, and 1937 turned out to be one of 
Packard’s best sales years). 
 
Charlie Steele, an Englishman, had been head of the Service Department. He knew Packards, and he 
was good. When he retired, a man named Buckley got the job. The mechanics I knew were Jimmy 
Lafferty, Eddie Cole, Spot Tyre, and Harry Meck. Lafferty was especially methodical, and he often 
came to Auburn Heights to work on my father’s personal cars (see the “News” of 3/25/13). He never 
owned a car. “Spot” bought a used ’32 Packard Standard Eight Club Sedan and kept it in mint 
condition. Cole left to open his own shop just off Washington Street near Lea Boulevard. In later years, 
several worked for Bill Luke at Delaware Oldsmobile, first at 13th and Market and then on Governor 
Printz Boulevard. Ira Johns, a smiling black man, was the washer and polisher, and cars that left the 
agency had his special shine. 
 
Competent men to run errands were essential, and the Packard dealership had three who come to mind. 
“Errands” entailed all sorts of things, such as driving cars from the Packard distributor at 400 North 
Broad Street in Philadelphia to chauffeuring special people on request. Clayton George helped drive 
my parents and me on a trip to Virginia Beach and Old Point Comfort in 1930. Before that, he probably 
drove my grandmother, Elizabeth Marshall, when she needed to go somewhere from her Wilmington 
apartment. During World War II, Clayton was a conductor on local Pennsylvania Railroad trains 
between Wilmington and Philadelphia. Bill Flinn lived with his parents near Greenville but had a weak 



heart that limited his physical activity. He could drive, however, and was completely capable. Joe 
Stoeckle, the son of a brewer at 5th and Adams streets who fell on hard times when prohibition took 
over in 1921, knew the Marshalls best, as he went on several trips with us, the longest of which was to 
the Century of Progress Exposition in Chicago in 1934. Stoeckle even helped my father with one or 
more trapshooting tournaments. He never had a well paying job, and the last time I saw him he was a 
bookkeeper for Hudson Supply Company near the foot of Market and Shipley streets.  
 
Five years ago today, Ruth and I moved out and turned over Auburn Heights to the state. We met 
Chazz Salkin and Ron Vickers in a law office in Wilmington, and in a few minutes it was done. 
 
Work Report: On Tuesday, November 19, the museum was rented out during our work session, and 
Susan Randolph and Jerry Novak took care of the group there. Seven volunteers took part in the work 
session in the shop and garage: Steve Bryce (in charge), Bill Schwoebel, Dennis Dragon, Bob Jordan, 
Ted Kamen, Jerry Lucas, and Tom Marshall. 
 
On the Model 607, the engine case that had been leaking oil was re-sealed and is now believed to be 
oil-tight. Wires for the dash light were studied further and a black loom covering was ordered to cover 
the section under the hood. One of the hood hinges was bent and not located correctly, so it was 
planned to address this at the next session. The spare rim (which fits the 725 and 735), was given a 
second coat of paint. Oil was added to the pump drive sump and the engine case on the Mountain 
Wagon. The leaking cylinder head on the Model 87 that had worked loose was repacked and tightened 
in preparation for testing. Vaporizer work continued on the new three-venturi burner for our Model K 
(and one for Allen Blazick). The signs and lights needed for the museum party were taken down after 
the party concluded. 
 
On Thursday, November 21, the following 12 volunteers answered the call: Bill Schwoebel (in charge), 
Bill Rule, Dennis Dragon, Ted Kamen, Jerry Koss, Gerhard Maute, Eugene Maute, Bob Stransky, 
Richard Bernard, Tim Ward, Kelly Williams, and Tom Marshall. 
 
The Model 87 was fired up and the cylinder head tested. It is tight, but the front head on the same 
cylinder (right side of car) now has a slight leak. This, too, has been tightened and is ready for an 
additional testing. A ring of packing was added to the steam automatic. The stem of one of the blow-
down valves was refaced. A new museum exhibit was prepared (by Bill Rule and Jesse Gagnon) 
showing how early motorists coped with winter driving in the snow and ice. On the 607, the new black 
loom was partially installed on the dash light wiring, the new weather stripping on the bottom of the 
windshield was shaved to the proper size, using the old one as a sample, and the off-line hood hinge 
was raised and straightened. Insertion of a longer or larger vaporizer cable to obtain a leaner fuel 
mixture was studied, and it was concluded that only longer will work, as it was not possible to get a 
larger diameter one to slide through. A new cable has been made. The careful cleaning of the original 
paint on the Model 750 continued, and improvement is evident. Several of the new stanchions received 
a second coat of yellow, and the steps inside the garage (to be removed) were further inspected to 
determine that they are not load-bearing. Library work continued as did the tedious vaporizer-and-
nozzle work for our Model K. 
 
Some new Turkish towels for shop rags arrived in the shop mysteriously, for which we thank the 
donor. We can use more old towels or wash cloths (terry cloth works best). Also, we need two well-
worn 23” tires for the rear of our Model 750 (32 x 4-1/2, 33 x 5, or 6:00-23). The car is not expected to 
run soon, but we need tires and tubes that will hold air so we can move it (we have tubes on hand). 


